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We are pleased to present to you this 
year’s Annual Quality Water Report. This 
report is designed to inform you about 
the quality of water and the services we 
provide to you every day. Our constant 
goal is to provide with a safe and 
dependable supply of drinking water. We 
want you to understand the efforts we 
make to continually improve the water 
treatment process and protect our water 
resources. We are committed to 
ensuring the quality of your water. 

Your source of water comes from the 
Detroit River, situated within the Lake St. 
Clair, Clinton River, Detroit River, Rouge 
River, Ecorse River, in the U.S. and 
parts of the Thames River, Little River, 
T u r k e y C r e e k a n d S y d e n h a m 
watersheds in Canada. The Michigan 
Department of Environment, Great 
Lakes, And Energy in partnership with 
the U.S. Geological Survey, the Detroit 
Water and Sewerage Department, and 
the Michigan Public Health Institute 
performed a source water assessment 

susceptibility rating is on a six-tiered 
scale from “very low” to “high” based 
primarily on geologic sensitivity, water 
chemistry, and contaminant sources. 
The susceptibility of our Detroit River 
source water intakes were determined to 
be highly susceptible to potential 
contamination. However, all four Detroit 
water treatment plants that use source 
water from the Detroit River have 
histor ical ly provided sat isfactory 
treatment of this source water to meet 
drinking water standards. 

GLWA has initiated source-water 
protection activities that include chemical 
containment, spill response, and a 
mercury reduction program. GLWA 
participates in a National Pollutant 
Discharge Elimination System permit 
d ischarge p rogram and has an 
emergency response management plan.   
GLWA has an updated Surface Water 
Intake Protection plan for Fighting Island 
Intake.  The plan has seven elements 
that include: rol ls and duties of 
government units and water supply 
agencies, delineation of approaches for 
protection, contingency plans, siting of 
new water sources, public participation, 
and public education activities. If you 
would like to know more about this 
report , p lease contact GLWA at 
(313-926-8127). 

We are pleased to report that our 
drinking water is safe and meets or 
exceeds federal and state requirements. 
In order to ensure that tap water is safe 
to drink, EPA prescribes regulations 
which limit the amount of certain 
contaminants in water provided by public 
water systems. FDA regulat ions 
establish limits for contaminants in 
bottled water, which must provide the 
same protection for public health. 
    GLWA routinely monitors for 
con taminan ts i n Be r l i n Char te r 
Township’s drinking water according to 
federal and state laws. The table 
provided shows the results of our 
monitoring for the period of January 1st 
2024, to December 31st, 2024. The 
State allows us to monitor for certain 
contaminants less than once per year 
because the concentration of these 
contaminants are not expected to vary 
significantly from year to year. All of the 
data is representative of the water 
quality, but some are more than one year 
old. 

S o m e p e o p l e m a y b e m o r e 
vulnerable to contaminants in drinking 
water than the general population. 
Immuno-compromised persons such as 
a person with cancer undergoing 
chemotherapy,  

persons who have undergone organ 
transplants, people with HIV/AIDS or 
other immune system disorders, some 
elderly, and infants can be particularly at 
risk from infections. These people should 
seek advice about drinking water from 
their health care providers, EPA/CDC 
guidelines on appropriate means to 
lessen the r i sk o f i n fec t ion by 
Cryptosporidium and other microbial 
contaminants are available from the 
S a f e D r i n k i n g W a t e r H o t l i n e 
(800-426-4791). 

Drinking water, including bottled 
water may reasonably be expected to 
contain at least small amounts of some 
con taminan ts . The p resence o f 
contaminants does not necessarily 
indicate that water poses a health risk. 
More information about contaminants 
and potential health effects can be 
obtained by calling the EPA’s Safe 
Drinking Water Hotline (800-426-4791). 

Lead can cause serious health 
effects in people of all ages, especially 
pregnant people, infants (both formula-
fed and breastfed}, and young children. 
Lead in drinking water is primarily from 
materials and parts used in service lines 
and in home plumbing.  Berlin Charter 
Township is responsible for providing 
high quality drinking water and removing 
lead pipes but cannot control the variety 
of materials used in the plumbing in your 
home. Because lead levels may vary 
over time, lead exposure is possible 
even when your tap sampling results do 
not detect lead at one point in time. You 
can help protect yourself and your family 
by identifying and removing lead 
materials within your home plumbing 
and taking steps to reduce your family's 
risk. Using a filter, certified by an 
American National Standards Institute 
accredited certifier to reduce lead, is 
effective in reducing lead exposures. 
Follow the instructions provided with the 
filter to ensure the filter is used properly. 
Use only cold water for drinking, 
cooking, and making baby formula. 
Boiling water does not remove lead from 
water. Before using tap water for 
drinking, cooking, or making baby 
formula, flush your pipes for several 
minutes, You can do this by running your 
tap, taking a shower, doing laundry, or a 
load of dishes. If you have a lead service 
line or galvanized requiring replacement 
service line, you may need to flush your 
pipes for at least 5 minutes to flush 
water from both your home plumbing 
and the lead service line. If you are 
concerned about lead in your water and 
wish to have your water tested, contact 
Jason Dobson from Berlin Charter 
Township for available resources. 
Information on lead in drinking water, 
testing methods, and steps you can take 
to minimize exposure is available at 
https://www.epa.gov/safewater/lead/. 
There is no safe level of lead in drinking 
water. Exposure to lead in drinking water 
can cause serious health effects in all 
age groups. Infants and children can 
have decreases in IQ and attention 
span. Lead exposure can lead to new 
learning and behavior problems or 
exacerbate existing learning and 
behavior problems. The children of 
persons who are exposed to lead before 
or during pregnancy can have increased 
risk of these adverse health effects. 
Adults can have increased risks of heart 
disease, high blood pressure, kidney, or 
nervous system problems. Berlin Charter 
Township has no known lead service 
lines. There are currently 3575 service 
lines with approximately 2000 service 
lines of unknown material. 

The sources of drinking water (both 
tap water and bottled water) include 
rivers, lakes, streams, ponds, reservoirs, 
springs and wells. As water travels over 
the surface of the land or through the 
ground, it dissolves naturally occurring 
minerals and, in some cases, radioactive 
material, and can pick up substances 
resulting from the presence of animals or 
from human activity. 

Contaminants that may be in source 
water: 

- Microbial contaminants, such as 
viruses and bacteria, which may 
come from sewage treatment plants, 
septic systems, agricultural livestock 
operations, and wildlife. 
- Inorganic contaminants, such as 
salts and metals, which can be 
naturally occurring or result from 
urban storm water runoff, industrial or 
domestic wastewater discharges, oil 
and gas production, mining, or 
farming. 
- Pesticides and herbicides, which 
may come from a variety of sources, 
such as agricultural, storm water 
runoff, and residential uses. 
- Organic chemical contaminants, 
including synthetic and volatile 
organic chemicals, which are by-
products of industrial processes and 
petroleum production, and can, also 
come from gas stations, urban storm 
water runoff, and septic systems. 
- Radioactive contaminants, which 
can be naturally occurring or be the 
result of oil and gas production and 
mining activities. 
In order to ensure that tap water is 

s a f e t o d r i n k , E PA p r e s c r i b e s 
regulations, which limit the amount of 
certain contaminants in water provided 
by public water systems. The Food and 
Drug Administration (FDA) regulations 
establish limits for contaminants in 
bottled water, which must provide the 
same protection for public health. 

Inadequately treated water may 
contain disease-causing organisms. 
These organisms include bacteria, 
viruses, and parasites, which can cause 
symptoms such as nausea, diarrhea, 
cramps, and associated headaches. 

Thank you for allowing us to continue 
providing your family with clean, quality 
water this year. In order to maintain a 
safe and dependable water supply we 
sometimes need to make improvements 
that will benefit all of our customers. 
These improvements are sometimes 
reflected as rate structure adjustments. 
Thank you for understanding. 

If you have any questions about this 
report or concerning your water utility, 
please contact Jason Dobson, Berlin 
Charter Township Water/Wastewater 
Superintendent 734-586-8680 ext. 6. We 
want our valued customers to be 
informed about their water utility. 

Copies of this report are available at 
Berlin Charter Township, 8000 Swan 
View Drive, Newport, MI 48166. Copies 
of this report will not be mailed. 
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